COUNCIL PRESIDENT-JENNIFER WASILK
COUNCIL AT LARGE-DAVID JANIK
COUNCIL AT LARGEJOSEPH MILLER
COUNCIL AT LARGE- PHIL VAN TREUREN

COUNCIL WARD ONE-BRIAN DEMBINSKI
COUNCIL WARD TWO- ED COWGER
COUNCIL WARD THREE-CHUCK WINIARSKI
COUNCIL WARD FOUR-MATT NAHORN

OFFICE OF THE OLGA SIVINSKI
CLERK OF COUNCIL ) ’ 206 SOUTH MAIN STREET
(440) 988-2420 AMHERST, OH 44001
(440) 988-2570 fax council@amherstohio.org
AGENDA

JULY 9, 2018 0-18-25

REGULAR MEETING R-18-04

7:00 P. M. A-18-32

1 Roll cal: Mr. Janik, Mr. Van Treuren, Mr. Dembinski, Mr. Cowger, Mr. Winiarski,

Mr. Nahorn Mr. Miller
2 Prayer. Chaplain Nahorn
3 Pledge to the Flag: Sergeant at Arms Dembinski

4 Consent Agenda: Minutes of the Regular Council Meeting held June 25 , 2018
Minutes of the Building and Lands Committee Meeting held July 9, 2018

5. Michael Kaczmarski, Director of Operations of WOW to provide updates to the project
6 Acknowledgement of the public pertaining to items on the agenda:

7. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS FIRST READING:

(a) An Ordinance repealing Chapters 1341, 1342, and 1344 of Part Thirteen, Title Three
of the Codified Ordinances of the City of Amherst and enacting a new Chapter 1340
Entitled “Property Maintenance” which adopts the International Property Maintenance
Code 2015 Edition including Appendix “A” thereto relating to Boarding Standards,
with certain Amendments and additional provisions, and amending Section 1125.03
of the Codified Ordinances to grant jurisdiction to the Board of Zoning Appeals to
hear and determine appeals from decision, notices or orders of the code official
acting under the International Property Maintenance Code.  (A-18-31)

8. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS SECOND READING:

(a) An Ordinance amending Amherst Codified Ordinance Chapter 1121, Section 1121.07
and amending Chapter 1145, Section 1145(a) and 1145(b). (A-18-29)

9. ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS THIRD READING:
(a) An Ordinance adopting a new Chapter 1153 to part Eleven, Title 5 of the Amherst

Codified Ordinances, entitled “Mobile Vending” pertaining to the regulation of mobile
vending and mobile vending devices within the city. (a-18-28)



Agenda Page 2

July 9, 2018

10 Miscellaneous and acknowledgement of the public:

11. Agenda requests and committee meeting schedules

12.  Reports of the Administration

13. Acknowledgement of the receipt of monthly reports from Auditor and Treasurer
14. Adjournment



A-18-31
ORDINANCE NO. O-18-

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING CHAPTERS 1341, 1342 AND 1344 OF PART
THIRTEEN, TITLE THREE OF THE CODIFIED ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
AMHERST AND ENACTING A NEW CHAPTER 1340 ENTITLED "PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE"  WHICH ADOPTS THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE 2015 EDITION INCLUDING APPENDIX "A" THERETO
RELATING TO BOARDING STANDARDS, WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS AND
ADDITIONAL PROVISIONS, AND AMENDING SECTION 1125.03 OF THE
CODIFIED ORDINANCES TO GRANT JURISDICTION TO THE BOARD OF
ZONING APPEALS TO HEAR AND DETERMINE APPEALS FROM DECISIONS,
NOTICES OR ORDERS OF THE CODE OFFICIAL ACTING UNDER THE
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee of the Council of the City of Amherst. Ohio.
met on July 9. 2018 to consider the matter of repealing Chapters 1341, 1342 and 1344 of Part
Mhivwen. Tide Thiee ol e Codithod Orlinances of the City of Anilserst aist enacting 6 new
chuper TR entitled  "Property Meeldleianee”  wihich mbopts the Intermational I rospreriy
Muintcnamce. Code 2105 Fditiin iochucling Appeilis A" e refuting 1 Boanding
stundards. with certnm amendiments sl odditivsal P s ard dmeisdng soction L 2A000
il e Condinfesl Lindinminees o gt jurtsdictaon o the Phasrd of ll".||||||=I "||:q|.‘;.||-; 1 heer and
determine sppenls From decisions. motiees or arbers of the code official e under e
International Property Maintenance Code: and

WHEREAS. the Buildings and Lands Committee determined to bring the matter to the Hoor ot
Council.

WHEREAS, the Courwil of thie Uity of Amherst deems it in the best interest of the City to
adopt such additions amil amendimivriis.

NOW. THEREFURE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Amherst, County of
Lorain, Stz o taf

SECTION I: That Chapters 1341, 1342 and 1342 of Part Thirteen, Title Three of the Codilied
Ordinances of the City of Amherst are hereby repealed.

SECTION 2: That the Council hereby enacts a new Chapter 1340 which in section 1340.01
adopts asl incorpuruies as part of the Amlierst Cuondilied Ordirmmnces, as it fully rewritten in
such sewtion. including Appendix A - Buuirding Sturubards, thal certain code known as the
International  I'roperty Maintenines Cade ("IPMC"). 2015 edition, as published by the
International Cinde Council, for negulating und governing the conditions and makntemance ot all
property. buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities
and other physical things and conditivns weseritial fo ensure bl structures are safe. saniiary and
fit for occupalion and use: and the vorsbemnution of buildings and structures unfit fir human
occupancy and use. and the demslition of such existing structures as herein provided: pruviding
for the issuance of permits wml vollection of fees therufure: and each and all of the regulativns.
provisions. penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on file in the
office of the Building Department are hereby referred to. adopted, and made a part hereot. as if
fully set out in this chapter, with the additions. insertions. deletions and changes. il any.
prescribed in section 1340.02,

SECTION 3: That a new Chapter 1340 entitled "Property Maintenance" is hereby adopted to
provide in its entirety as follows.

CHAPTER 1340
Property Maintenance Code

1340.01 Adopted.

1340.02 Amendments.

1340.03 Code provisions to be minimum regulations; additional requirements.
1340.04 Parking and storage of vehicles.

1340.99 Penalty; other remedies.



CROSS REFERENCES
Adoption of technical code by reference - see Ohio R ¢ 731 23|
Junk vehicles - see [RAF 303 10
Nuisance conditions - see GEN OFF Ch 321
Weed control - see GEN OFF Ch 337

1340.01 ADOPTED.

() The City adopts and incorporates as part of the Amherst Coditied
Ordinances, as il fully rewritten herein including Appendix A - Boarding Standards.
that certain code known as the International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC). 2015
edition. as published by the International Code Council (ICC) tor regulating and
governing the conditions and maintenance of all property. buildings and structures: by
providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and
conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe. sanitary and fit for occupation and
use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit tor human occupancy and
use, and the demolition of such existing structures as herein provided: providing tor the
issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore: and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties. conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on tile in
the office of the Building Department are hereby referred to. adopted. and made a part
hereof. as if fully set out in this chapter. with the additions. insertions, deletions and
changes. if any, prescribed in Section 1340 02

(b) Any ordinance and/or resolution in contlict with subsection (a) hereof
is repealed to the extent of such conflict

1340.02 AMENDMENTS.
The following sections of said International Property Maintenance Code. 2015 edition,
are hereby revised in the following respects:

(a) Section 101.1 Title. Insert: City of Amherst. Ohio

(b) Section 102.3  Application of other codes. Amend to: Repairs,
additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy. shall be done in
accordance with the procedures and provisions of the building codes adopted by the
City in PART THIRTEEN, TITLE ONE - "Standards" ot these codified ordinances
Nothing in this code shall be construed to cancel. modify or set aside any provision of
the City's Planning and Zoning Code

(c) Section 103.1 General. Insert the following second sentence: The
code officiul shall be the Building Ofticial as defined and identitied in section 1331 .02
of these codified ordinances.

(d) Section 103.5 Fees. Insert: ". .. shall be as indicated in chapter 1137
of these codified ordinances.
(e) Section 106.4 Violation penalties. Add the tollowing final sentence:

"Prosecution of violations, penalties and other remedies shall be in accordance with
section 1340 99 of these codified ordinances "

H Section 110.03 Failure to comply. If the owner of a premises fails to
comply with a demolition order within the time prescribed. the code official shall cause
the structure to be demolished and removed, either through an available public agency
or by contract or arrangement with private persons. and the cost of such demolition,
removal. site restoration and associated administrative expenses shall be charged
against the real estate upon which the structure is located. Such amount shall be
certified to the County Auditor by the Law Director or hisfher designee for collection
the same as other taxes and assessments are collected. pursuant to Sections 715 261 (B)
(1) and (C) of the Ohio Revised Code

(g) Sections 111.1  Application for appeal. Amend to provide: Any
person directly affected by a decision of the code official or a notice or order issued
under this code shall have the right to appeal to the Board of Zoning Appeals pursuant
to section 1125.03(b) of these coditied ordinances. provided that written application for
appeal is filed within thirty (30) days after the date of the decision. notice or oider was
served. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this
code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted. the
provisions of this code do not fully apply. or the requirements of this code are
adequately satisfied by other means.

(h) Sections 111.2 through 111.9. Delete entirely

(i) Section 112.4 Failure to Comply. Insert: Any person who shall
continue any work after having been served with a stop work order. except such work
as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition. shall be
subject to penalties pursuant to section 1340.99 contained herein.

) Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert in first paragraph: “eight (8) inches™



(k) Section 304.14 Insect Screens. Insert: “May o October™
h Section 602.3 Heat supply. Insert: ~October 1o May™
(m) Section 602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Insert: ~Octlober o May ™

1340.03 CODE PROVISIONS TO BE MINIMUM REGULATIONS;
ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS.

jinl (ITS prayvisims ol the Inleritnmml |‘1-I[I|.'||:| Maoduicimimes Cinle, e
adipted By the Cas . oane lerehy conbinmad o B minfman regikations gingriihes che
midtatenaiie ul all stmeiures, propers, sl beiklngs el within tee Oy, the
primwisions of Seutknd 13EUT amnl the Propery Mainicasmee Code alall ol b
comisbnies] i repeal, disploce, override e cender inapplicable g adiditiaed
rujiatre s sl lorth i lese Coalitiod ©ndinmees Felabpieg 1 e spectli vecuprtigs
s or milenance of and stiucture or propeds. sl adklishomal requirenents i
il b supplenssi ti i requiremdng e fatlom e Propens Suiniemis
il

(b) Fhe spusitiv amd additionul sewiinaismsts relatmg o parking il sborage
of vediicles set fuwth in this Cuale and all whier feguirements relalinig to use lieiehi and
area fegulations us set Forthi in Chapter 1145 sne bereby dechived o not be im conf] s
with the Praperty Maintenance Code. as enacted. but represent supplemental and/or
additional regulations relating property use and maintenance within the City.

1340.04 PARKING AND STORAGE OF VEHICLES.
The followsig pmavisions shall apply to vehicles located in all zoning districts
unless otherwise spiiiiual
(a) Mohick: Parking amsl Swrage.  Dacept as otliersise  specitically
provided in Part Fleven v Pan Ihirieen af the Amherst Codilwsl Ordinances. all
vehicles shall be properly parked in a driveway as detined in section 1121 07 ol
Cluaprsw FE21 ar the g o, o gpush g Lot or o pudkiieg space as defined in sastion
FUEL O, o b uslisriged aon permitied stricione. Vehicles which aie inoperulile or
wlhischi o il bive 8 cirmenl reigistmation sl B siorsd in a compleiely enchised,
autlwsridicl v |>|.'I1I'|i|1|.'|] strnghing o e preamises.
(b) Temporary Exceptions
(n Not more often than two (2) times in any twelve (12) month
period, the owner of a premises may allow vehicles to be
parked on such premises in violation of division (a) of this
section for a period not to exceed ninety-six (96) hours. To
exercise such right, such owner shall notity the police
departiment of such infent at least twenty-four (24) hours in

advance.
2) Vehicles used in farming. as defined in section 1121.07, on the
premises on which such vehicles are located.
(¢) Storage af Commercial and Iubustrial. Vebicles, Equipmseni and/or

Materials. Storage of vehicles, equipment and materials relating to commercial or
industrial uses is prohibited in residential zoned districts. unless otherwise specifically
permitted in the Zoning Code, and with the exception of vehicles used by the resident(s)
of the premises for personal transportation purposes.

(d) wotatia Jos Waedstion, The Building Official, or his/lier desigiws. and
any member of the Aiifrersl pilice department shall have the right o #sse a citition to
any projierts aswner in violation of this section. The property owner shall be required to
pay a fiiie il twenty-five dollars ($25.00) for each vehicle in violation of this section.
Any property owner who does not pay the fine within fourteen (14) days shall be
subject to enforcement and penalties set forth in section 1340.99.

(e) Public Sissoce e storage of a motor vehicle in an inoperable
condition or withenil @ wurnei registration in violation of division (a) of this section for
a perkid of more than fourteen (14) days is dewmed a public nuisiive and shall be
subijeci to abatement by the City.  The cost il remuival and associateil adminmirative
expenses shall be charged against the real estate upon which the structure is located.
Suchi mmount shall by cemifivad to the County Asulite by the Law Directar or his/her
desigiew for cullevtivn the anine as other tnxes umd iiwsg==meits are colbected. pursuant
to Sectsins 715 21 (L] hud (C) of the [ Heir Kt iad £ exle



1340.99 PENALTY; OTHER REMEDIES.

(a) Fine  Whoever violates any provision of this chapter, or any eflective
rule or regulation promulgated hereunder. or fails to comply therewith or with any written
notice or written order issued hereunder, or whoever refuses to permit lawful entry by the
Building Otficial or other City department heads or their representatives, and whoever
interferes with, vbstructs or hinders such Building Ofticial while attempting to make a
law ful inspection, shall be fined not more than two hundred filty ($250.00) for each
offense. Each day any such violation of this chapter is committed. continued or permitted
shall constitute a separate oftense

(b) Other remedies The imposition of any penalty shall not preclude the
Law Director from instituting an appropriate action or proceeding in a court of proper
Jurisdiction to prevent an unlawful repair or maintenance; or to restrain. correct or abate a
violation. or to prevent the occupancy of a building. structure or premises, or (o require
compliance with the provisions of this chapter. or other applicable laws. ordinances. rules
or regulations. or the orders or determinations of the Building Official or the Board

SELUTION 41 That section 1123.03 of the Cudlilied Ordinances of the City of Amherst is
herele amended to provide in its entirety as (ol

1125.03 APPEALS.

Yy alecisnm ol ihe HIII.|I|||I[] Illl-\.l'l.'l.l-\.l| anle m e enfore e ol 1lias __.".Hq".!_-
Lol sl sndy decision. molece o aider ol e Lok LHFickel windvr 1l Pruperis
Mainbermanoe Code may be appsakal s thie Boand of Zoning Appeals B iy person
ddversely alfecied, An appenl may e pertected By ibe appelfam filing with e
Aecrglany o e Boand o e ol s asenlion dppwal. accompanied oo
twritrafimslnbde foe of fliny-fve dollars 4535000 For resickanieal, ooe Bundred dhellirs
($100.00) for commercial and fitty dolars ($50.00) for a renewal of a variance to cover
the waimt il alvertising the sppeal sl the mailing of sotices. e Tl dispusinin of an
appenl shall be in the tomm ! pnesolaisim cither ces e e imaliliying or J,||'|r|||ing e
decision il e Rgriklimg Inspector or Cesle UfFicial. 100 sesolaton Lails to revsive tinge
vistes i Favir of the sppidlenl. or i Bar s o isediflcamm of e dicisio appsitd
tfoim, e witiin obiall he deened ceptinvabam toon dvmal ond shall be Gamaally gironed
wipes the reeond,  Th Bl shall be given s ressnible time in reiderig i desiskng in
avappel Sl periosd shall no exceed Gifeen divs. With the covsent of this apiella,
atich perkal may by exdended unil e aes et ing ol e Maianl

SECTION 5: That it is found and determined that all Tormal actions of this Council
concerming ol selating W the adepion of this Ordiminee were wlopiet i ) e
mecting of this Comeil, md thie all deliberations of this Couseil wmd of oy of s
copmmyitbees that resulied inosuch il aclicm, were in meetiis open W the public. in

somnplismee with wll lepal reguirensenls, mehaling Sectican 12022 o0 the Ulio Bevised

Code.

SECTION 6° That this Ordinance shall take effect at the earliest period allowed by law.

1" reading

o reading Jennifer Wasilk. President of Council

3" reading
PASSED APPROVED

ATTEST
Mark Costilow. Mayor

Approved as to form by

Anthony R. Pecora. Director of Law

Filed with the Mayor:

A-18-31



